



## Statement

Statement No. 1184  
Date: 11/28/2022  
Due Upon Receipt

BRDWID  
P.O. Box 19656  
Happy Jack, AZ 86024-0656

### Statement of Account

Outstanding Balance	New Charges	Amount in Trust	Payments Received	<b>Total Amount Outstanding</b>
( \$0.00	+ \$25,410.00	)- ( \$0.00	+ \$0.00	) = <b>\$25,410.00</b>

#### Blue Ridge Domestic Water Improvement District-01246

#### General Representation

Date	Description	Quantity	Rate	Total
07/28/2022	Document review / revision: Review of court documents from adverse party; research and review of claims related to same; preparation of court document in response to same	1.50	\$300.00	\$450.00
08/03/2022	Correspondence Exchange: Review of correspondence from client regarding requested disclosures; review of previous disclosures and legal research regarding scope of disclosures regarding same	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
08/05/2022	Correspondence Exchange: Exchange of correspondence with client regarding disclosures; review of same and legal research related to same	1.70	\$300.00	\$510.00
08/09/2022	Document review / revision: Review of file documents, communications and disclosures; preparation of same for distribution; exchange of correspondence with client regarding same	3.50	\$300.00	\$1,050.00
08/22/2022	Correspondence Exchange: Review of correspondence from adverse counsel and teleconference with client regarding same; legal research regarding same	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
08/23/2022	Correspondence Exchange: Exchange of correspondence with client and adverse counsel regarding public comment; preparation of response to same	1.50	\$300.00	\$450.00
08/24/2022	Correspondence Exchange: Exchange and review of correspondence with client and adverse counsel regarding public comments	0.40	\$300.00	\$120.00
08/25/2022	Correspondence Exchange: Preparation of correspondence to client	0.20	\$300.00	\$60.00
09/01/2022	Document review / revision: Review of IGA and legal research regarding same; exchange of correspondence with client regarding same	3.20	\$300.00	\$960.00
09/08/2022	Teleconference: Teleconference with associated counsel regarding pending adverse motions and claims; review of same; preparation of responses to same and legal research regarding same	2.40	\$300.00	\$720.00
09/09/2022	Document preparation: Preparation of response to motion; legal research regarding same; preparation of correspondence to AG regarding training deadline	3.70	\$300.00	\$1,110.00
09/12/2022	Document review / revision: Review and revision of response to motion; preparation of correspondence to client and related parties regarding same	2.80	\$300.00	\$840.00

09/13/2022	Teleconference: Exchange of correspondence with client regarding pending disclosures; review and research regarding claims related to same	2.10	\$300.00	\$630.00
09/14/2022	Correspondence Exchange: Preparation of correspondence to client; review of court documents from adverse counsel	0.30	\$300.00	\$90.00
09/19/2022	Document review / revision: Review of correspondence from adverse counsel and preparation of correspondence to client regarding same; review of disclosures and prior disclosure production related to same	2.60	\$300.00	\$780.00
09/20/2022	Teleconference: Teleconference with client regarding disclosure requests; legal research related to same; review of prior disclosures and production	2.50	\$300.00	\$750.00
09/22/2022	Correspondence Exchange: Exchange of correspondence with adverse counsel regarding disclosure time frames; teleconference with same regarding same; review of disclosures and requirements related to same	2.80	\$300.00	\$840.00
09/26/2022	Document review / revision: Review of court documents and correspondence from AG; review of disclosures and legal research regarding same	2.90	\$300.00	\$870.00
10/03/2022	Document review / revision: Review of correspondence from client and teleconference with client regarding same; review of disclosures	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
10/04/2022	Document preparation: Review of disclosures and preparation of discovery responses	1.80	\$300.00	\$540.00
10/05/2022	Document preparation: Preparation of discovery responses; review of documents and legal research regarding same; exchange of correspondence with client regarding same	3.60	\$300.00	\$1,080.00
10/06/2022	Document preparation: Preparation of discovery responses; review of documents and legal research related to same; preparation of correspondence to client regarding same	4.10	\$300.00	\$1,230.00
10/07/2022	Document review / revision: Review and revision of disclosures; preparation of correspondence to adverse counsel regarding same; exchange of correspondence with client regarding same	1.70	\$300.00	\$510.00
10/12/2022	Document preparation: Preparation of court documents; review of party disclosures; preparation for hearing; review of correspondence from adverse party regarding same	2.70	\$300.00	\$810.00
10/14/2022	Document preparation: Preparation of court documents and submittal of same; exchange of correspondence and teleconference with client regarding same	1.10	\$300.00	\$330.00
10/21/2022	Document preparation: Preparation of court documents; review of party disclosures; preparation for hearing	1.60	\$300.00	\$480.00
10/24/2022	Document preparation: Preparation of court documents; review of party disclosures; preparation for hearing; review of correspondence from associated party regarding same	2.80	\$300.00	\$840.00
10/27/2022	Teleconference: Exchange of correspondence and teleconference with client regarding information request and public hearing; review of disclosures and court documents related to same	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
11/01/2022	Preparation for hearing: Preparation for hearing; teleconferences with client and associated counsel regarding same; review of disclosures and legal research related to same	2.80	\$300.00	\$840.00
11/02/2022	Court Hearing: Attendance at public hearing; preparation for court hearing; review of court record, disclosures and legal research related to same	3.80	\$300.00	\$1,140.00
11/03/2022	Teleconference: Teleconference with client regarding hearing and testimony; preparation of and legal research regarding same; attendance at court hearing	3.60	\$300.00	\$1,080.00
11/04/2022	Preparation for hearing: Preparation for hearing; exchange of correspondence with client regarding same	1.90	\$300.00	\$570.00
11/06/2022	Preparation for hearing: Preparation for hearing	1.80	\$300.00	\$540.00
11/07/2022	Court Hearing: Preparation for, travel to and attendance at court hearing	9.50	\$300.00	\$2,850.00
			<b>Subtotal</b>	<b>\$25,410.00</b>
			<b>Total</b>	<b>\$25,410.00</b>

## Detailed Statement of Account

### Current Invoice

Invoice Number	Due On	Amount Due	Payments Received	Balance Due
1184	11/28/2022	\$25,410.00	\$0.00	\$25,410.00
<b>Outstanding Balance</b>				<b>\$25,410.00</b>
<b>Amount in Trust</b>				<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>Total Amount Outstanding</b>				<b>\$25,410.00</b>

Make checks payable to: Riley S. Snow PLC

Pay your bill online: <https://secure.lawpay.com/pages/rileysnow/ccpayment>

Mail payment to: 2036 N. Gilbert Road, Ste. 2-264, Mesa, AZ 85203

Account balances more than 30 days past due will accrue interest at the rate of 18% per annum